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8th March 2024  

Dear parents/carers and families, 

This week has really been very full of great joy! The trip on Wednesday to the Hall for Cornwall to sing with 
Will Keating was truly amazing. It is so important to ensure that our children learn about our Cornish 
Heritage, music and working with other children. This was an excellent opportunity for this and a fantastic 
time was had by all! A huge thank you to all of the volunteer helpers that came along with us. We find it 
quite tricky to do these trips due to the cost of transport and the amount of adults needed to meet ratios – 
without all of the wonderful volunteers we really wouldn’t have been able to take part, so a huge, sincere 
thank you to you all. 

Similarly, World Book Day was wonderful. The children had made such an excellent effort with their 
costumes and book choices. Thank you parents for your support in this! It is so important to ensure that 
children develop a love of reading and World Book Day always offers up an excellent opportunity for our 
whole community to get behind this. The children in all classes took part in some excellent online author 
visits, book related activities and Trevose made some beautiful keyrings to mark the experience. 

Looking ahead to next week, we have Comic Relief on Friday where we are asking children to come to school 
in their pyjamas. Our school council asked for a PJ day and so we thought this was an excellent opportunity 
to combine the children’s wishes and Comic Relief fundraising. We also understand that not everyone wants 
to wear PJ’s so please just come in your normal uniform if you do not wish to take part. Please do make sure 
your children have a coat and suitable footwear however, as playtimes in slippers might be a first aid 
nightmare!! Thank you in advance. 

On Wednesday and Thursday, we have parent’s evening. Please do come to the meetings on time and 
remember that each meeting has a short ten-minute slot that teachers need to stick to, to avoid long delays 
with other parents who may be waiting. If you feel that you need more time with the teacher, we ask that 
you make another appointment by contacting the teacher on Seesaw. 

I hope that you all have a wonderful weekend celebrating Mother’s Day, and today on what is International 
Women’s Day, celebrating all of the women in our lives that have been excellent role models, caregivers and 
inspirations to us. 

With warmest wishes as always 

Mrs Ellie Watkins 
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Head teacher 

Kehelland Shining Light 

Tamzin for always being enthusiastic & always giving her best effort 

Lighthouse Keeper Award 

Longships –  Ailla for taking care over the 

organisation of her writing 

Trevose – Rosie for outstanding effort with her 

World Book Day costume 

Tater Du –  William G for excellent behaviour & 

trying hard all the time 

Reader of the Week Award 

Longships –  George for practising every day at home 

Trevose – Demelza for her enthusiasm & diligence 

when reading 

Tater Du –  Jacob for reading all the time 

Class Weekly Attendance  

Longships – 97.3% Trevose – 95.7% Tater Du  94.9% 

 

        

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Red Nose Day 

 

 

 

 

School Meals 

Week commencing:  

11th March 

 

Week 2  

Cost £2.65 per meal 

Order via Parentpay 

by 8:30am 

 

FOKS – Friends of Kehelland School 

 

                                      

 

 

 

 

Don’t forget to go 

via easy fund raising 

when doing your 

online shopping. 

Over 7000 brands 

will donate part of 

your spend to a 

cause of your choice 

at no extra cost to 

you. Our page is 

called Kehelland 

Village School PTSCA. 

 

Events: 

26th March – Break the rules day. 20p per rule broken. 

There will be up to 10 rules to break, each rule with a 20p 

fine. Please see flyer attached to email.  

30th March - Easter Trail at Cornhill Farm at 2pm – Cake 

Donations & Volunteers, would be appreciated! Please 

book your child’s space by emailing 

info@cornhillfarm.co.uk or kehelland@tpacademytrust.org  

Grant 
We have successfully obtained a grant of just over £21000 

to spend on outdoor play equipment! Watch this space! 

Thanks to www.ggscf.org.uk 

 

 

mailto:kehelland@tpacademytrust.org
mailto:info@cornhillfarm.co.uk
mailto:kehelland@tpacademytrust.org
http://www.ggscf.org.uk/


                                                                            
Kehelland, Camborne, TR14 0DA 

Website: www.kehellandschool.co.uk 
Phone: 01209 643143 

Email: kehelland@tpacademytrust.org 
 

 Head Teacher: Mrs Ellie Watkins        
                                                

 
Kehelland Village School is part of Truro and Penwith Academy Trust, a charitable company limited by guarantee, registered in England and Wales.  

Company Number: 08880841.  Registered address: Academy House, Truro Business Park, Threemilestone, Truro TR4 9LD 
 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Diary Dates - Term dates can be found on our website 

13th & 14th March 2024  Parents Evenings 

15th March 2024    Comic Relief – Wear PJs  

26th March 2024   FOKS – Break the Rules Day – please note new date 

26th March 2024   Showcase Afternoon– From 2pm 

27th March 2024   Rocksteady Concert for Rocksteady Children  

28th March 2024   Break up for Easter Holidays at 1:15pm  

30th March 2024   Easter Trail at Cornhill Farm, 2pm 

15th April 2024    Return to School  

27th – 31st May 2024   May Half Term 

3rd & 4th June 2024   Inset Days  

28th June 2024    Sports Day 

23rd July 2024    Break up for Summer Holidays at 1:15pm  

24th July 2024     Inset Day  
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